
Procurement Contract Officer:  Vicki Collins  6707 OF

Ammunition
Opening Date:  7/13/22 

Line # CALIBER DESCRIPTION
Estimated Annual 

Usage

Unit of Measure 

(CS)
Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case

9 mm Duty

135 Grain Luger+P Critical Duty Hornady #90225  or 

EQUIVALENT

50RD/BX 10 BX/CASE

222.50$                            218,050.00$                     286.40$                            $280,672.00

9 mm Training

135 GRAIN, Luger FMJ Training

Hornady 90238  or EQUIVALENT

50 RD/BX  10BX/CASE

130.00$                            13,000.00$                       215.70$                            21,570.00$                       

9 mm Training

115 Grain, Luger TAP Training

Hornady 90249  or EQUIVALENT

50 RD/BX; 10 BX/CASE

277.00$                            1,246,500.00$                  

9 mm Training

115 Grain, Luger FMJ Training

FIOCCHI #CH9AP   or EQUIVALENT 

50RD/BX 10 BX/CASE

 $                           237.54  $                      71,262.00 111.00$                            33,300.00$                       270.40$                            81,120.00$                       

 $                      71,262.00  $                    264,350.00  $                 1,629,862.00 

Line # CALIBER DESCRIPTION
Estimated Annual 

Usage

Unit of Measure 

(CS)
Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case

.223 Caliber Training

55 Grain, REM Spire Point Training 

Hornady Frontier #FR120  or EQUIVALENT

20 OR 50 RD/BX; 1000 RD/CASE 

334.10$                            66,820.00$                       

.223 Caliber Training

55 Grain, FMJ Training REM Winchester #USA223R1  

NO ALTERNATE ACCEPTED

20 OR 50 RD/BX; 1000 RD/CASE 

$400.00 1,040,000.00$                  

.223 Caliber Training

55 Grain, FMJ Training, REM      

Hornady #80275 or EQUIVALENT

20 OR 50 RD/BX; 1000 RD/CASE

 $                           223.63  $                    742,451.60 $400.00 1,328,000.00$                   $                           498.00  $                 1,653,360.00 

.223 Caliber Duty 

53 Grain, FMJ GMX TAP Patrol Duty, REM Hornady 

#80295

NO ALTERNATE ACCEPTED

20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CASE

234.50$                            286,090.00$                     

.223 Caliber Duty 

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, New Casings; Winchester 

RA223R-PSP, Federal T223A, 

NO ALTERNATE ACCEPTED

20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CASE

 $                           279.72  $                      55,944.00 111.20$                            22,240.00$                       

6.5MM 

147 Grain, Creedmoor ELD-Match TAP Hornady #81505 ;  

or EQUIVALENT

MUST BE FROM THE SAME LOT

20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CS

296.40$                            118,560.00$                     

308 Caliber Duty

168 Grain, WIN ELD Match TAP Precision, 

Hornady #80725 or EQUIVALENT

20 RD/BX

221.49$                             $                      44,298.00 272.50$                            54,500.00$                       

5.56 Caliber Duty

75 Grain, NATO BTHP Match, 

Frontier #FR320 or EQUIVALENT

20 RD/BX, 500 RD/CS
367.50$                            643,125.00$                     

5.56 Caliber Training

55 Grain, NATO FMJ TAP, 

Hornady  #81278 or EQUIVALENT

50 RD/BX, 500 RD/CS

200.00$                            40,000.00$                       

5.56 Caliber Duty

53 Grain, NATO GMX TAP Patrol, 

Hornady #81275 or EQUIVALENT

20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CS
234.50$                            140,700.00$                     

 $                    842,693.60  $                 3,073,365.00  $                 2,320,030.00 

Line # CALIBER DESCRIPTION
Estimated Annual 

Usage

Unit of Measure 

(CS)
Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case Unit Price         ( Per Case) Extended Price per case

00 BUCK Duty
12 Gauge 9 Pellet Duty, Federal LE127-00 or 

EQUIVALENT

250 RD/CS

 $                           172.05  $                      17,205.00 

Bird Shot

7.5-8 PELLET, Winchester TRG127, Federal TGL 128 or 

EQUIVALENT

250 RD/CS

 $                             80.46  $                        8,046.00 73.75$                              7,375.00$                         

 $                      25,251.00  $                        7,375.00  $                                  -   

17

T223A

500 round case

20-24 months

NA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

WINCHESTER 

USA223R1

120

Federal

NO BID

1E092110

60-120     20/CASE

HORNADY

80255

60-90    500 RD/CASE

 NA 

NO BID

RA556M

180

WINCHESTER 

Q3131K

No Bid

P.O.R

P.O.R

120

CS

100 CS

No Bid

100

CS

CS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

15 Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

16 Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

CS

14

Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

600 CS

13
Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

200

Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

12 1750 CS

ARO Days

9

10

Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

11 Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

400

Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

200

200

CS

Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

8 1220 CS

ARO Days

2600 CS6

7 Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

3320 CS

ARO Days

5
Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

TOTAL

43%

HORNANDY DOMESTIC
0% 30 Days

90-365 Days

4500 CS

300 CS

200 CS

Delivery Days ARO

Kiesler Police Supply Inc

Section II. O. Must be Fet exempt. SectionVI. C-E No Bid

Section VI. F. 1-2. Federal AE9DP; 7. 20 box per case 50 rd 

boxes 1000 case; 8. 270-730 days  Federal AE9DP 1000 rds 

per case. Must order by the case. minimum order for drop ship 

is 3 cases. Lead time may vary. 

Section VI. G.-H. No Bid

Section VI. I. 1-2. Federal AE223; 7. 25 boxes per case, 20 

rds per box. 500 rds per case; 8. 600-730 days; Federal 

AE223 50 rds per case. Must order by the case. Minimum 

order for drop ship is 3 case total. Lead time may vary.

Section VI. J. No Bid  Section K.1-2 Federal T223A; 8. 20; 9. 

600-730 days Federal T223A 200 rds per cas. must order by 

the case. Minimum order for drop ship is 3 cases, total. Lead 

time may vary. Seciton VI. L. No bid Section M. 1-2 Federal 

GM308M; 6. 20 rounds; 7. 27-730 ARO; Federal GM308M 

200 rds per case. Must order by the case. Minimum order is 3 

case for drop shipping. Lead time may vary.

AE9DP

1000 rds per case

Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

3
Specify Brand:

ARO Days

Payment Terms 0% 30 

TOTAL

50%

WINCHESTER LE MSRP PRICE LIST

OTHER AMMUNITION

NON-CORE

STATE % OF DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG/PRICE LIST

State Catalog and/or Price List Name: 

NON-CORE AMMUNTION

15%

KIESLER CATALOG

Sunset Law Enforcement LLCRay O' Herron Co

PISTOL AMMUNITION

RIFLE AMMUNITION

SHOTGUN AMMUNITION

WINCHESTER

RA9B1

365

HORNADY

AGUILA

TOTAL

1

2

980 CS

Specify Brand:

Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

Specify Model:

4

No Bid
Specify Brand:

Specify Model:

ARO Days

Specify Model:

ARO Days

100 CS No Bid

90225

30-60

WINCHESTER 

USA9MM1

365+

HORNADY

90238

60-90

60-120

9-24 months

WINCHESTER 

Q4172

365+

AGUILA

1E097704

60-120   20/CS

Federal

No Bid

HORNADY

81505

30-60

AE223

500 round case

20-24 months

WINCHESTER 

USA223R1

120

AGUILA

1E223110

NA
WINCHESTER 

RA223R

Federal

GM308M

200 rds per case

HORNADY

80295

30-60

120

No Bid

9-24 months

HORNADY

80725

30-60

WINCHESTER 

No Bid

Federal

HORNADY

812.75

30-60

Federal

LE12700

250 rd case

 NA 

9-24 months

Federal

TGL12/8

250 rd case

9-24 months

WINCHESTER 

Section VI. C. 1. 9MM, 147 GR. Bonded; 2. Winchester 

RA9B1; 3. 147 GR; 6. 333; 8. 365 ARO; $222.50/per case of 

500 rounds. Section VI. D. 1. 147 GR, 9MM FMJ; 2. 

Winchester SKU USA9MM1; 3. 147 GR; 6. 990; 8. 365+ 

ARO; $130/per case of 500 rounds. Section VI. F. 1. 115 GR 

9MM Winchester; 2. Winchester SKU Q4172; 6. 1190; 8. 

365+ ARO; $111/per case of 500 rounds, Section VI. H. 8. 

20; 9. 120 Days; $400/per case of 1000 rounds, Section VI. I. 

1. 55 GR 223 Cal; 2. Winchester SKU USA 223 R1; 7. 20; 8. 

120 ARO; $200/per case of 500 rounds, Section VI. K. 9. 120 

Days; $111.20/per case of 200 rounds, Section VI. N. 1. 77 

GR; 2. Winchester SKU RA556M; 3. 77 GR; 5. 2750; 7. 180 

Days; $367.50/per case of 500 rounds, Section VI. O. 2. 

Winchester SKU Q3131K; 6. 20; 7. 120 ARO; $200/per case 

of 500 rounds, Section VI. R. 1. Winchester TRGT127; 7. 180 

ARO; $73.75/per case 250 rounds, 

0% 30 Days

Vendor altered Description information on following:

 Lines 3=Changed from 10 BX/Case to 20

 Line 4=Changed from 10 BX/Case to 20

Line 5=Changed 1000 RD/Case to 500

Section VI. C. 7. 50 Rds, VI. D. 7. 50 Rds, E. 1. MB Aquila 

brand 124 gr 9mm; 2.MB Aquila brand #1E092110; 3. MB 

Aquila brand 124 gr; 7. 50/Bx - 20bx/case; Hornady has 

Discontinued #90249, Proposed is Aquila brand 9mm, 124 gr 

FMJ, 50 rds per box, 20 bx per case (1,000 per case), F. 1. 

MB Aquila #1E097704; ,2. MB Aquila brand #1E097704; 7. 

50/Bx- 20 bx/case; Fiocchi Products have had sustantial Price 

increases. Proposed product meets all requirements and is 

cost effective Packaged 50 rds/bx, 20 bx per case, Section VI. 

G. 1-2. Hornady #80255; 6. 50/Bx; 80255 is a Hornady 

product produced in Grand Island, NE using exact bullet as 

FR120., Section VI. I. 1. Aguila brand #1E223110; 2. Aquila 

1E223110; 7. 50/Bx; Aquila brand #IE223110 is cost 

effective equivalent product. Packaged 50 rds/bx, 20 bx per 

case (1,000), Section VI. J. 8. 20, Section VI. M.6. 20/Bx,   

Comments

TRGT127

180

No Bid

No Bid
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